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Unusual presentation of a mass and “cobble-stone 
like” changes in the bronchus of a patient with granu-
lomatosis with polyangitis
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A 44-year-old male was diagnosed with granulomatosis with 
polyangiitis (GPA) 1 year ago because of intermittent cough, 
short of breath, epistaxis, hearing loss and a positive protein-
ase-3 anti-neutrophilic cytoplasmatic antibody (PR3-ANCA) 
test. After being treated with oral prednisone, cyclophospha-
mide for a year, he was hospitalized due to reappearance 
of cough and epistaxis. The nasopharyngoscopy showed 
extensive necrosis of the left nasal cavity. The biopsy of na-
sal cavity mucosa revealed fibrinoid necrotizing vasculitis 
(Figure 1A). His chest computed tomography (CT) showed 
multiple nodules and cavities (Figure 1B). Bronchoscopy 
showed diffuse edematous hypermic mucosal changes 
and cobble-stone like lesions (Figure 1C, 1D). A narrowed 
tracheobronchus could be seen and a whitish mass which 
moved back and forth with breathing could be observed in the 
bronchi (Figure 1E). Bronchoscopic biopsy was performed. 
The pathology showed nonspecific inflammation (Figure 1F). 
Bronchial lavage fluid were negative for bacterial and fungal 
cultures both. After being treated with 500 mg methylpred-
nisolone intravenously for 3 days, the patient’s cough and 
epistaxis disappeared.

Bronchoscopic examination is thought to be useful in detect-
ing the abnormal bronchial findings of GPA.[1] The most com-
mon airway abnormalities in GPA are mucosal edema, ery-
thema, thickening, and granularity of mucosal surface could 
be seen. Persistent mucosal inflammation followed by fibro-
sis is responsible for bronchial stenosis. GPA can also cause 
tracheal or bronchial mass lesions, called‘‘inflammatory 

pseudotumor’’. In general, “cobble-stone like” mucosa or in-
flammatory pseudotumor in airway indicate active disease.[2] 
The quick treatment response of this patient suggested that 
the changes of this patient was acute inflammation and could 
be reversed. 

Figure 1:  (A) Pathological changes of the nasal cavity mucosa bi-
opsy: inflammatory exudates, granulomas formation with 
necrosis, and fibrinoid necrosis of a small vascular walls. (B) 
Chest CT: multiple nodules and cavities. (C, D and E) Bron-
choscopic observations: the mucosa of bronchus was edema, 
hyperemia (blue arrow in Figure C), narrowing of the middle 
lobe of the right lung (black arrow in Figure C), “cobble-stone” 
changes of the mucosa (blue arrow in Figure D), whitish mass 
in the lumen of upper lobe of the left lung (blue arrow in Fig-
ure E). (F) HE staining with transbronchoscopic biopsy of the 
“cobble-stone like” changes of the bronchial mucosa: chronic 
mucosal inflammation with necrosis, granulation formation 
with squamous metaplasia (X 200). CT, computed tomogra-
phy; HE, hematoxylin-eosin.
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